

Bid Tabulation Report
Vendor Prices by Item

Bid Request: **9120 Dairy Products and Fruit Juices**
 Cycle: 6 From: **07/01/2021 To: 06/30/2023**
 Buyer: Caleb Young

04/21/2021
 Page 1 of 23
 38075

Group Item RPS Desc: **Milk, Grade A, whole, homogenized, pasteurized, 3.5% butterfat, fortified with vitamin D; 1 gallon container.**

18374

58 **MCPS #702160**
QUANTITY IS ESTIMATED MONTHLY

Number
 of Units Bid Unit
150 Each

Whs #: 0

Vendor Name	Vendor Number	Seq No	Discount Price	Unit Price	Discount	Vendor Quantity	Vendor Unit of Issue	Vendor Packaging	Brand	Model	S/H Sub
DAIRY MAID DAIRY LLC	4436	1	2.8953	2.8953	0.00		Each		DAIRY MAID DAIRY		
CLOVERLAND FARMS DAIRY	4199	1	3.96	3.96	0.00		Each		CLOVERLAND	4/case	

Bid Tabulation Report
Vendor Prices by Item

Bid Request: **9120 Dairy Products and Fruit Juices**
 Cycle: 6 From: **07/01/2021 To: 06/30/2023**
 Buyer: Caleb Young

04/21/2021
 Page 2 of 23
 38075

Group Item RPS Desc: **Milk, Grade A, whole, homogenized, pasteurized, 3.25% butterfat, fortified with vitamin D; 8 oz plastic bottles; 50 ct/case.**

Number
 of Units Bid Unit
100 Each

18377 65 Price per bottle: \$ _____

Whs #: 0 MCPS #702135

Vendor Name	Vendor Number	Seq No	Discount Price	Unit Price	Discount	Vendor Quantity	Vendor Unit of Issue	Vendor Packaging	Brand	Model	S/H Sub
DAIRY MAID DAIRY LLC	4436	1	.3201	.3201	0.00		Each		DAIRY MAID DAIRY		
CLOVERLAND FARMS DAIRY	4199	1	.35	.35	0.00		Each				

Bid Tabulation Report
Vendor Prices by Item

Bid Request: **9120 Dairy Products and Fruit Juices**
 Cycle: 6 From: **07/01/2021 To: 06/30/2023**
 Buyer: Caleb Young

04/21/2021
 Page 3 of 23
 38075

Group Item RPS Desc: **ALTERNATE FOR #18377: Milk, Grade A, whole, homogenized, pasteurized, 3.25% butterfat, fortified with vitamin D, one-half pint cartons; 50 ct/** Number
37553 Price per carton: \$ _____ of Units Bid Unit
 Whs #: **MCPS #702135** **100 Each**

Vendor Name	Vendor Number	Seq No	Discount Price	Unit Price	Discount	Vendor Quantity	Vendor Unit of Issue	Vendor Packaging	Brand	Model	S/H Sub
DAIRY MAID DAIRY LLC	4436	1	.2601	.2601	0.00		Each		DAIRY MAID DAIRY		
CLOVERLAND FARMS DAIRY	4199	1	.30	.30	0.00		Each		CLOVERLAND		

Bid Tabulation Report

Vendor Prices by Item

Bid Request: **9120 Dairy Products and Fruit Juices**
 Cycle: 6 From: **07/01/2021 To: 06/30/2023**
 Buyer: Caleb Young

04/21/2021
 Page 4 of 23
 38075

Group Item RPS Desc: **Cottage Cheese, Grade A, lowfat, 2.0% butterfat; 5 lb. container.**

18382

70

MCPS #702125
QUANTITY IS ESTIMATED MONTHLY

Number
 of Units Bid Unit
10 Each

Whs #: 0

Vendor Name	Vendor Number	Seq No	Discount Price	Unit Price	Discount	Vendor Quantity	Vendor Unit of Issue	Vendor Packaging	Brand	Model	S/H Sub
DAIRY MAID DAIRY LLC	4436	1	7.4119	7.4119	0.00		Each		UPSTATE FARMS		
CLOVERLAND FARMS DAIRY	4199	1	7.75	7.75	0.00		Each		UPSTATE FARMS	4/case ; 1% Butterfat	

Bid Tabulation Report

Vendor Prices by Item

Bid Request: **9120 Dairy Products and Fruit Juices**
 Cycle: 6 From: **07/01/2021 To: 06/30/2023**
 Buyer: Caleb Young

04/21/2021
 Page 5 of 23
 38075

Group Item RPS Desc: **Cottage cheese, Grade A, lowfat, 2.0% butterfat; 24 ounce container.**

18384

72 **MCPS #702126**
QUANTITY IS ESTIMATED MONTHLY

Number
 of Units Bid Unit
10 Each

Whs #: 0

Vendor Name	Vendor Number	Seq No	Discount Price	Unit Price	Discount	Vendor Quantity	Vendor Unit of Issue	Vendor Packaging	Brand	Model	S/H Sub
CLOVERLAND FARMS DAIRY	4199	1			0.00		Each				
Buyer Note: NO BID											
DAIRY MAID DAIRY LLC	4436	1	2.7919	2.7919	0.00		Each		UPSTATE FARMS		

Bid Tabulation Report
Vendor Prices by Item

Bid Request: **9120 Dairy Products and Fruit Juices**
 Cycle: 6 From: **07/01/2021 To: 06/30/2023**
 Buyer: Caleb Young

04/21/2021
 Page 6 of 23
 38075

Group Item RPS Desc: **Milk, Grade A, homogenized, pasteurized, non-fat cultured buttermik; 1 quart container.**

18387

75 **MCPS #702130**
QUANTITY IS ESTIMATED MONTHLY

Number
 of Units Bid Unit
1250 Each

Whs #: 0

Vendor Name	Vendor Number	Seq No	Discount Price	Unit Price	Discount	Vendor Quantity	Vendor Unit of Issue	Vendor Packaging	Brand	Model	S/H Sub
DAIRY MAID DAIRY LLC	4436	1	.8801	.8801	0.00		Each		DAIRY MAID DAIRY		
CLOVERLAND FARMS DAIRY	4199	1	1.21	1.21	0.00		Each		CLOVERLAND		

Bid Tabulation Report
Vendor Prices by Item

Bid Request: **9120 Dairy Products and Fruit Juices**
 Cycle: 6 From: **07/01/2021 To: 06/30/2023**
 Buyer: Caleb Young

04/21/2021
 Page 7 of 23
 38075

Group Item RPS Desc: **Sour cream, Grade A, Low Fat; 5 lb container.** Number
18389 78 **MCPS #702155** of Units Bid Unit
QUANTITY IS ESTIMATED MONTHLY **50 Each**
 Whs #: 0

Vendor Name	Vendor Number	Seq No	Discount Price	Unit Price	Discount	Vendor Quantity	Vendor Unit of Issue	Vendor Packaging	Brand	Model	S/H Sub
CLOVERLAND FARMS DAIRY	4199	1	6.75	6.75	0.00		Each		UPSTATE FARMS	4/case	
DAIRY MAID DAIRY LLC	4436	1	9.4595	9.4595	0.00		Each		UPSTATE FARMS		

Bid Tabulation Report

Vendor Prices by Item

Bid Request: **9120 Dairy Products and Fruit Juices**
 Cycle: 6 From: **07/01/2021 To: 06/30/2023**
 Buyer: Caleb Young

04/21/2021
 Page 8 of 23
 38075

Group Item RPS Desc: **Yogurt, made from cultured, Grade A pasteurized milk, lowfat, No HFCS and Gluten Free, preferably without gelatin, assorted blended flavors; or** Number
18400 160 **State flavors available with code numbers:** of Units Bid Unit
 Whs #: 0 **15000 Each**

Vendor Name	Vendor Number	Seq No	Discount Price	Unit Price	Discount	Vendor Quantity	Vendor Unit of Issue	Vendor Packaging	Brand	Model	S/H Sub
CLOVERLAND FARMS DAIRY	4199	1			0.00		Each				
Buyer Note: NO BID											
DAIRY MAID DAIRY LLC	4436	1	.575	.575	0.00		Each		UPSTATE FARMS	Blueberry, Peach, Cherry Vanilla, Strawberry Banana & Strawberry	

Bid Tabulation Report
Vendor Prices by Item

Bid Request: **9120 Dairy Products and Fruit Juices**
 Cycle: 6 From: **07/01/2021 To: 06/30/2023**
 Buyer: Caleb Young

04/21/2021
 Page 9 of 23
 38075

Group Item RPS Desc: **Half & Half, Milk and Cream, homogenized, pasteurized, individual creamers; 3/8 oz. each; 400 ct/case.**

18405

168 MCPS #702171
 QUANTITY IS ESTIMATED MONTHLY

Number
 of Units Bid Unit
10 Case

Whs #: 0

Vendor Name	Vendor Number	Seq No	Discount Price	Unit Price	Discount	Vendor Quantity	Vendor Unit of Issue	Vendor Packaging	Brand	Model	S/H Sub
CLOVERLAND FARMS DAIRY	4199	1	13.00	13.00	0.00		Case		CLOVERLAND	1/case	
DAIRY MAID DAIRY LLC	4436	1	16.9532	16.9532	0.00		Case		BALFORD FARMS		

Bid Tabulation Report

Vendor Prices by Item

Bid Request: **9120 Dairy Products and Fruit Juices**
 Cycle: 6 From: **07/01/2021 To: 06/30/2023**
 Buyer: Caleb Young

04/21/2021
 Page 10 of 23
 39360

Group Item RPS Desc: **Fruit juice, orange, 100% juice, 4 oz. non-glass container; 50 ct/case.**

18406

169

MCPS #702110

QUANTITY IS ESTIMATED MONTHLY IF BONUS 4 OZ. COMMODITY ORANGE JUICE IS NOT AVAILABLE

Number
 of Units Bid Unit
205000 Each

Whs #: 0

Vendor Name	Vendor Number	Seq No	Discount Price	Unit Price	Discount	Vendor Quantity	Vendor Unit of Issue	Vendor Packaging	Brand	Model	S/H Sub
DAIRY MAID DAIRY LLC	4436	1	.1456	.1456	0.00		Each		GROVE FRESH	Waxpaper Carton / 50 count per case	
CLOVERLAND FARMS DAIRY	4199	1	.23	.23	0.00		Each		CLOVERLAND	75/case	

Bid Tabulation Report
Vendor Prices by Item

Bid Request: **9120 Dairy Products and Fruit Juices**
 Cycle: 6 From: **07/01/2021 To: 06/30/2023**
 Buyer: Caleb Young

04/21/2021
 Page 11 of 23
 38075

Group Item RPS Desc: **Half & Half, Milk and Cream homogenized, pasteurized, minimum 10.5% milkfat; 1 quart container.**

24237

MCPS #702170
 QUANTITY IS ESTIMATED MONTHLY

Number
 of Units Bid Unit
24 Each

Whs #:

Vendor Name	Vendor Number	Seq No	Discount Price	Unit Price	Discount	Vendor Quantity	Vendor Unit of Issue	Vendor Packaging	Brand	Model	S/H Sub
CLOVERLAND FARMS DAIRY	4199	1	1.44	1.44	0.00		Each		CLOVERLAND	16/case	
DAIRY MAID DAIRY LLC	4436	1	1.511	1.511	0.00		Each		DAIRY MAID DAIRY		

Bid Tabulation Report

Vendor Prices by Item

Bid Request: **9120 Dairy Products and Fruit Juices**
 Cycle: 6 From: **07/01/2021 To: 06/30/2023**
 Buyer: Caleb Young

04/21/2021
 Page 12 of 23
 38075

Group Item RPS Desc: **Yogurt, Grade A, Vanilla, Nonfat, No HFCS, Gluten Free, 1% milkfat; 5 lb container.**

24239

MCPS #702152
 QUANTITY IS ESTIMATED MONTHLY

Number
 of Units Bid Unit
500 Each

Whs #:

Vendor Name	Vendor Number	Seq No	Discount Price	Unit Price	Discount	Vendor Quantity	Vendor Unit of Issue	Vendor Packaging	Brand	Model	S/H Sub
DAIRY MAID DAIRY LLC	4436	1	5.6879	5.6879	0.00		Each		UPSTATE FARMS		
CLOVERLAND FARMS DAIRY	4199	1	6.75	6.75	0.00		Each		UPSTATE FARMS	4/case	

Bid Tabulation Report
Vendor Prices by Item

Bid Request: **9120 Dairy Products and Fruit Juices**
 Cycle: 6 From: **07/01/2021 To: 06/30/2023**
 Buyer: Caleb Young

04/21/2021
 Page 13 of 23
 39360

Group Item RPS Desc: **Fruit Juice, orange, 100% juice, one-half pint non-glass container; 50 ct/case.**

30134

MCPS #XXXXXX
 QUANTITY IS ESTIMATED MONTHLY

Number
 of Units Bid Unit
50 Each

Whs #:

Vendor Name	Vendor Number	Seq No	Discount Price	Unit Price	Discount	Vendor Quantity	Vendor Unit of Issue	Vendor Packaging	Brand	Model	S/H Sub
-------------	---------------	--------	----------------	------------	----------	-----------------	----------------------	------------------	-------	-------	---------

CLOVERLAND FARMS DAIRY	4199	1			0.00		Each				
------------------------	------	---	--	--	------	--	------	--	--	--	--

Buyer Note: NO BID

DAIRY MAID DAIRY LLC	4436	1			0.00		Each				
----------------------	------	---	--	--	------	--	------	--	--	--	--

Buyer Note: ITEM NOT AVAILABLE

Bid Tabulation Report
Vendor Prices by Item

Bid Request: **9120 Dairy Products and Fruit Juices**
 Cycle: 6 From: **07/01/2021 To: 06/30/2023**
 Buyer: Caleb Young

04/21/2021
 Page 14 of 23
 39360

Group Item RPS Desc: **Fruit juice, 100% juice, Apple flavor 4 oz. non-glass container; 75 ct/case.**

34521

QUANTITY IS ESTIMATED MONTHLY

Number
 of Units Bid Unit
165000 Each

Whs #:

Vendor Name	Vendor Number	Seq No	Discount Price	Unit Price	Discount	Vendor Quantity	Vendor Unit of Issue	Vendor Packaging	Brand	Model	S/H Sub
DAIRY MAID DAIRY LLC	4436	1	.1317	.1317	0.00		Each		GROVE FRESH		
CLOVERLAND FARMS DAIRY	4199	1	.18	.18	0.00		Each		CLOVERLAND		

Bid Tabulation Report
Vendor Prices by Item

Bid Request: **9120 Dairy Products and Fruit Juices**
 Cycle: 6 From: **07/01/2021 To: 06/30/2023**
 Buyer: Caleb Young

04/21/2021
 Page 15 of 23
 38075

Group Item RPS Desc: **Milk, Grade A, white, homogenized, pasteurized, 1.0% butterfat, fortified with vitamins A and D; 8 oz plastic bottles; 50 ct/case.**

37550

Price per bottle: \$ _____

Number
 of Units Bid Unit
155000 Each

Whs #: **MCPS #702105**

Vendor Name	Vendor Number	Seq No	Discount Price	Unit Price	Discount	Vendor Quantity	Vendor Unit of Issue	Vendor Packaging	Brand	Model	S/H Sub
DAIRY MAID DAIRY LLC	4436	1	.2824	.2824	0.00		Each		DAIRY MAID DAIRY		
CLOVERLAND FARMS DAIRY	4199	1	.33	.33	0.00		Each		CLOVERLAND		

Bid Tabulation Report
Vendor Prices by Item

Bid Request: **9120 Dairy Products and Fruit Juices**
 Cycle: 6 From: **07/01/2021 To: 06/30/2023**
 Buyer: Caleb Young

04/21/2021
 Page 16 of 23
 38075

Group Item RPS Desc: **ALTERNATE FOR #37550: Milk, Grade A, white, homogenized, pasteurized, 1.0% butterfat, fortified with vitamins A and D; one-half pint cartons;** Number
18369 50 Price per carton: \$ _____ of Units Bid Unit
 Whs #: 0 **MCPS #702105** **155000 Each**

Vendor Name	Vendor Number	Seq No	Discount Price	Unit Price	Discount	Vendor Quantity	Vendor Unit of Issue	Vendor Packaging	Brand	Model	S/H Sub
DAIRY MAID DAIRY LLC	4436	1	.2224	.2224	0.00		Each		DAIRY MAID DAIRY		
CLOVERLAND FARMS DAIRY	4199	1	.28	.28	0.00		Each		CLOVERLAND		

Bid Tabulation Report

Vendor Prices by Item

Bid Request: **9120 Dairy Products and Fruit Juices**
 Cycle: 6 From: **07/01/2021 To: 06/30/2023**
 Buyer: Caleb Young

04/21/2021
 Page 17 of 23
 38075

Group Item RPS Desc: **Milk, Grade A, chocolate-flavored, homogenized, pasteurized, skim, fortified with vitamins A and D, preference for sugar content not greater than** Number
37551 Price per bottle: \$ _____ of Units Bid Unit
 Whs #: **MCPS #702100** **70000 Each**

Vendor Name	Vendor Number	Seq No	Discount Price	Unit Price	Discount	Vendor Quantity	Vendor Unit of Issue	Vendor Packaging	Brand	Model	S/H Sub
DAIRY MAID DAIRY LLC	4436	1	.2922	.2922	0.00		Each		DAIRY MAID DAIRY		
CLOVERLAND FARMS DAIRY	4199	1	.34	.34	0.00		Each		CLOVERLAND		

Bid Tabulation Report
Vendor Prices by Item

Bid Request: **9120 Dairy Products and Fruit Juices**
 Cycle: 6 From: **07/01/2021 To: 06/30/2023**
 Buyer: Caleb Young

04/21/2021
 Page 18 of 23
 38075

Group Item RPS Desc: **ALTERNATE FOR #37551: Milk, Grade A, chocolate-flavored, homogenized, pasteurized, skim, fortified with vitamins A and D; one-half pint cart** Number
18371 55 Price per carton: \$ _____ of Units Bid Unit
 Whs #: 0 **MCPS #702100** **70000 Each**

Vendor Name	Vendor Number	Seq No	Discount Price	Unit Price	Discount	Vendor Quantity	Vendor Unit of Issue	Vendor Packaging	Brand	Model	S/H Sub
DAIRY MAID DAIRY LLC	4436	1	.2322	.2322	0.00		Each		DAIRY MAID DAIRY		
CLOVERLAND FARMS DAIRY	4199	1	.29	.29	0.00		Each		CLOVERLAND		

Bid Tabulation Report
Vendor Prices by Item

Bid Request: **9120 Dairy Products and Fruit Juices**
 Cycle: 6 From: **07/01/2021 To: 06/30/2023**
 Buyer: Caleb Young

04/21/2021
 Page 19 of 23
 38075

Group Item RPS Desc: **Milk, Grade A, skim, homogenized, pasteurized, 0% butterfat, fortified with vitamins A and D; 8 oz plastic bottles; 50 ct/case.**

37554

Price per bottle: \$ _____

Number
 of Units Bid Unit
20000 Each

Whs #: **MCPS #702140**

Vendor Name	Vendor Number	Seq No	Discount Price	Unit Price	Discount	Vendor Quantity	Vendor Unit of Issue	Vendor Packaging	Brand	Model	S/H Sub
DAIRY MAID DAIRY LLC	4436	1	.2694	.2694	0.00		Each		DAIRY MAID DAIRY		
CLOVERLAND FARMS DAIRY	4199	1	.32	.32	0.00		Each		CLOVERLAND		

Bid Tabulation Report
Vendor Prices by Item

Bid Request: **9120 Dairy Products and Fruit Juices**
 Cycle: 6 From: **07/01/2021 To: 06/30/2023**
 Buyer: Caleb Young

04/21/2021
 Page 20 of 23
 38075

Group Item RPS Desc: **ALTERNATE FOR #37554: Milk, Grade A, skim, homogenized, pasteurized, 0% butterfat, fortified with vitamins A and D; one-half pint cartons; 50** Number
18379 67 Price per carton: \$ _____ of Units Bid Unit
 Whs #: 0 **MCPS #702140** **20000 Each**

Vendor Name	Vendor Number	Seq No	Discount Price	Unit Price	Discount	Vendor Quantity	Vendor Unit of Issue	Vendor Packaging	Brand	Model	S/H Sub
DAIRY MAID DAIRY LLC	4436	1	.2094	.2094	0.00		Each		DAIRY MAID DAIRY		
CLOVERLAND FARMS DAIRY	4199	1	.27	.27	0.00		Each		CLOVERLAND		

Bid Tabulation Report
Vendor Prices by Item

Bid Request: **9120 Dairy Products and Fruit Juices**
 Cycle: 6 From: **07/01/2021 To: 06/30/2023**
 Buyer: Caleb Young

04/21/2021
 Page 21 of 23
 39360

Group Item RPS Desc: **Fruit juice, apple,100% juice, 8 oz. non-glass container; 50 ct/case.**

39070

QUANTITY IS ESTIMATED MONTHLY

Number
 of Units Bid Unit
50 Each

Whs #:

Vendor Name	Vendor Number	Seq No	Discount Price	Unit Price	Discount	Vendor Quantity	Vendor Unit of Issue	Vendor Packaging	Brand	Model	S/H Sub
-------------	---------------	--------	----------------	------------	----------	-----------------	----------------------	------------------	-------	-------	---------

DAIRY MAID DAIRY LLC	4436	1			0.00		Each				
----------------------	------	---	--	--	------	--	------	--	--	--	--

Buyer Note: ITEM NOT AVAILABLE

CLOVERLAND FARMS DAIRY	4199	1			0.00		Each				
------------------------	------	---	--	--	------	--	------	--	--	--	--

Buyer Note: NO BID

Bid Tabulation Report
Vendor Prices by Item

Bid Request: **9120 Dairy Products and Fruit Juices**
 Cycle: 6 From: **07/01/2021 To: 06/30/2023**
 Buyer: Caleb Young

04/21/2021
 Page 22 of 23
 38075

Group Item RPS Desc: **Yogurt, made from cultured, Grade A pasteurized milk, lowfat, No HFCS and Gluten Free, preferably without gelatin, assorted blended flavors; 4** Number
39335 QUANTITY IS ESTIMATED MONTHLY of Units Bid Unit
 Whs #: **70000 Each**

Vendor Name	Vendor Number	Seq No	Discount Price	Unit Price	Discount	Vendor Quantity	Vendor Unit of Issue	Vendor Packaging	Brand	Model	S/H Sub
DAIRY MAID DAIRY LLC	4436	1	.29	.29	0.00		Each		YOPLAIT/TRIX		
CLOVERLAND FARMS DAIRY	4199	1	.34	.34	0.00		Each		DANNON		

Bid Tabulation Report
Vendor Prices by Item

Bid Request: **9120 Dairy Products and Fruit Juices**
 Cycle: 6 From: **07/01/2021 To: 06/30/2023**
 Buyer: Caleb Young

04/21/2021
 Page 23 of 23
 38075

Group Item RPS Desc: **Yogurt, Grade A, Plain, non-fat, No HFCS, Gluten Free; 5 lb container.**

43899

QUANTITY IS ESTIMATED MONTHLY

Number
 of Units Bid Unit
10 Each

Whs #:

Vendor Name	Vendor Number	Seq No	Discount Price	Unit Price	Discount	Vendor Quantity	Vendor Unit of Issue	Vendor Packaging	Brand	Model	S/H Sub
DAIRY MAID DAIRY LLC	4436	1	5.14	5.14	0.00		Each		UPSTATE FARMS		
CLOVERLAND FARMS DAIRY	4199	1	6.75	6.75	0.00		Each		UPSTATE FARMS	4/case	

Sequence: Document Sequence Number within Suggested Aggregate